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J U N E

COME JOURNEY WITH US

ARRIVE! We’ll journey to the beautiful
Sacred Valley to acclimate. Enjoy a
relaxing massage, age-defying facial, or
go for a hike in the Andes mountains
with a local guide. Among other things,
you will visit an indigenous Peruvian
weaver's home and learn how the
Quechua people weave their history into
the beautiful textiles. 

9
JUNE

Inca Trek: You’ll walk the ancient paths
of the Inca Empire, surrounded by lush
rainforests, towering mountains, and
stunning archaeological wonders. The
Inca Trail will be an unparalleled
trekking experience, blending
breathtaking landscapes with rich
cultural immersion, not to mention the
opportunity to connect with yourself
and some pretty badass friends.

12
JUNE  

MACHU PICCHU: Our private guide will
take us on a once-in-a-lifetime
exploration of some of the most revered
ancient ruins in the world, explaining in
the detail desired the history of this
magical place. Be ready to be amazed.
We’ll take a train ride back that
journeys through mountains along the
Urubamba river. 

CUSCO: Here Explore the charm &
vibrant history of Cusco. From the
ancient Inca architecture, to the markets,
and colorful textiles, you are sure to be
enamored as you sink into your
experience. And don't forget about the
chocolate class that will definitely leave
you wanting for more! Journey home the
14th with unmatchable memories.
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